

Sturm Reporting Services, Inc.

2144 Gray Avenue
 St. Louis, MO 63117

Invoice

Date	Invoice #
4/7/2013	8130

Bill To
Patrick Chassaing, Esq. Curtis, Heinz, Garrett & O'Keefe 130 South Bemiston, #200 St. Louis, MO 63105

Description	Amount
Adam Paul vs. City of Ellisville, et al.	
Deposition of Paul Martin, Volume I, taken on behalf of Plaintiff on 3/20/13: 195 pages, one copy @ \$1.75 per page: E-Transcript:	341.25 25.00
Depositions of Paul Martin, Volume II, and Troy Piper taken on behalf of Plaintiff on 3/21/13: 184 pages, one copy @ \$1.75 per page: E-Transcripts, 2 @ \$25.00:	322.00 50.00
Deposition of Kevin L. Bookout taken on behalf of Plaintiff on 3/25/13: 80 pages, one copy @ \$1.75 per page: E-Transcript:	140.00 25.00
Deposition of Matt Pirrello and Paul Martin, Volume III, on 3/27/13 108 pages, one copy @ \$2.75 per page: (Same-day delivery) E-Transcript, 2 @ \$25.00:	297.00 50.00
Margaret Walsh, CCR Jo Ann Sturm, CCR, CSR (MO-IL), RPR	
Federal ID:43-1735882	
Total	\$1,250.25

ECKENRODE - MAUPIN
Attorneys at Law
8000 Maryland Avenue, Suite 1300
St. Louis, MO 63105
(314) 726-6670

INVOICE

Kevin Bookout
City Manager
#1 Weis Avenue
Ellisville MO 63111

Page: 1
04/11/2013
Account No: 67-2921M
Statement No: 17793

City of Ellisville v. Adam Paul

Fees

		Hours	
03/01/2013			
JWM	Reviewed preliminary resolution concerning the removal of Mayor Adam Paul.	0.20	40.00
03/05/2013			
JWM	Reviewed notice of closed meeting.	0.10	20.00
JWM	Reviewed motion to issue subpoenas duces tecum.	0.50	100.00
JWM	Reviewed original resolution.	0.70	140.00
03/06/2013			
JWM	Meeting with city council.	0.80	160.00
03/07/2013			
JWM	Reviewed amended resolution.	0.30	60.00
03/08/2013			
JWM	Reviewed request for larger venue for hearing.	0.30	60.00
JWM	Reviewed objection and responses to motion for subpoenas duces tecum.	0.50	100.00
JWM	Conference call with Casey Communications.	1.20	240.00

Kevin Bookout

Page: 2

04/11/2013

Account No: 67-2921M

Statement No: 17793

City of Ellisville v. Adam Paul

			Hours	
03/18/2013	JWM	Conducted hearing on objection to subpoena duces tecum.	0.80	160.00
03/19/2013	JWM	Prepared order on objection to subpoena duces tecum.	0.70	140.00
03/20/2013	JWM	Secured/attended deposition of Paul Martin.	8.00	1,600.00
	JWM	Meeting with city council.	0.80	160.00
03/21/2013	JWM	Secured/attended the continued deposition of Paul Martin and deposition of Troy Pieper.	8.00	1,600.00
03/25/2013	JWM	Secured/attended deposition of Kevin Bookout	3.50	700.00
03/27/2013	JWM	Secured/attended deposition conclusion of Paul Martin and the deposition of Matt Pirello	4.00	800.00
	JWM	Reviewed petition and writ.	2.40	480.00
03/28/2013	JWM	Prepared motion to dismiss.	3.80	760.00
	JWM	Attend court hearing on motion to dismiss.	2.50	500.00
03/29/2013	JWM	Reviewed court ruling and discuss with attorneys.	0.30	60.00
	JWM	Reviewed Adam Paul's filing with the court of appeals.	1.40	280.00
04/01/2013	JWM	Reviewed suggestions in support of petition for writ of prohibition.	0.10	20.00
	JWM	Reviewed petition for writ of prohibition.	0.30	60.00
	JWM	Reviewed writ summary.	0.10	20.00
	JWM	Reviewed court of appeal's ruling.	0.20	40.00
	JWM	Prepared for hearing.	3.00	600.00
	JWM	Conduct hearing.	6.00	1,200.00

Kevin Bookout

04/11/2013

Account No: 67-2921M

Statement No: 17793

City of Ellisville v. Adam Paul

		Hours	
04/02/2013			
JWM	Reviewed relator's (Adam Paul) motion to dispense with time limits in rule 84.24(e).	0.10	20.00
JWM	Reviewed letter to clerk from Keith Cheung re: respondent City of Ellisville's suggestions in opposition to relator's petition for a writ of prohibition.	0.10	20.00
JWM	Prepared for continuation of hearing and legal research.	1.20	240.00
JWM	Reviewed Mr. Paul's request for writ of prohibition filed with the Supreme Court.	0.40	80.00
JWM	Serve as hearing officer for continuation of hearing.	6.00	1,200.00
04/03/2013			
JWM	Serve as hearing officer for conclusion of hearing.	4.50	900.00
JWM	Conducted legal research re: motion to strike testimony.	0.80	160.00
04/07/2013			
JWM	Review and plan hearing procedure for deliberations.	0.80	160.00
04/08/2013			
JWM	Prepared for meeting.	3.00	600.00
JWM	Serve as hearing officer.	3.50	700.00
04/10/2013			
JWM	Prepared, review and finalize Findings of Fact, Conclusions of Law and Judgment.	5.00	1,000.00
JWM	Reviewed letter from Lynette Petruska re: sunshine law request.	0.10	20.00
	For Current Services Rendered	76.00	15,200.00

Recapitulation

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Total</u>
John W. Maupin	76.00	\$200.00	\$15,200.00

Expenses

03/06/2013	Photocopy expense (at .15 per page) for copy of e-mails.	15.30
03/13/2013	Photocopy expense (at .15 per page) for copy of relevant cases.	6.00
03/26/2013	Photocopy expense (at .15 per page) for copy of e-mail messages produced at deposition.	10.20
03/28/2013	Photocopy expense (at .15 per page) for copies of motion to dismiss.	20.85

Kevin Bookout

City of Ellisville v. Adam Paul

04/01/2013	Photocopy expense (at .15 per page) for copy of amended resolution of removal.	1.35
	Total Expenses	<u>53.70</u>

Advances

04/09/2013	Court reporter fee advanced to Sturm Reporting Services for copy of transcripts of depositions of Paul Martin (Vols. 1 - 3), Troy Pieper, Kevin Bookout and Matt Pirrello.	1,250.25
	Total Advances	<u>1,250.25</u>

Total Current Work 16,503.95

Balance Due \$16,503.95

Billing History				
<u>Fees</u>	<u>Expenses</u>	<u>Advances</u>	<u>Finance Charge</u>	<u>Payments</u>
15,200.00	53.70	1,250.25	0.00	0.00

Our Taxpayer ID # is 43-1804474

Thank you for allowing us to serve you.